Bid For

Middle Paxton Township
Bid on

Solid Waste and Recycling

September 8, 2022
Submitted by:

Waste Management of Pennsylvania, Inc.



NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

State of Pennsylvania : VCounty of Bucks
I state that I am (Title) President of
(Name of Firm) _ Waste Management of Pennsylvania, Inc. and that I am authorized to

make this affidavit on behalf of my firm, and its owners, directors, and officers. I am the person
responsible in my firm for the price(s) and the amount of this bid.

I state that:

(1) The price(s) and amount of this bid have been arrived at independently and without
consultation, communication or agreement with any other contractor, bidder, or potential
bidder.

(2) Neither the price(s) nor the amount of the bid, and neither the approximate price(s)
nor approximate amount of this bid, have been disclosed to any other firm or person who
is a bidder or potential bidder, and they will not be disclosed before bid opening.

(3) No attempt has been made or will be made to induce any firm or person to refrain
from bidding on this contract, or to submit a bid higher than this bid, or to submit any
intentionally high or noncompetitive bid or other form of complementary bid.

(4) The bid of my firm is made in good faith and not pursuant to any “agreement or
discussion with, or inducement from, any firm or person to submit a complementary or
other noncompetitive bid.

(5) (Name of Firm)_Waste Management of Pennsylvania, Incits affiliates, subsidiaries,
officers, directors and employees are not currently under investigation by any governmental
agency and have not in the last four years been convicted or found liable for any act
prohibited by State or Federal law in any jurisdiction, involving conspiracy or collusion
with respect to bidding on any public contract, except as follows:

Waste Management of Pennsylvania, Inﬁ

I state that (Name or Firm) nderstands and

acknowledges that the above representatives are material and important, and will be I relied on by
The Township in awarding the contract(s) for which this bid is submitted. I understand and my firm
understands that any misstatement in this affidavit is and shall be treated as fraudulent concealment
from The Township of the true facts relating to the submission of bids for this contract.

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED : By:
BEFORE ME THIS _2/4 DAY _
,2022. Christopher Farley

OF
ot k Name
L) Me Aoty ‘
Notary Publi¢ President
Title

My Commission Expires:

- Commonwealth of Pennsylvania - Notary Seal .

B
My Commission Expires August 28, 2023

ROSE KAMINSKI, Notary Public
ucks

Commission Number 1081396

v



Bid Bond

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS that we,

WASTE MANAGEMENT OF PENNSYLVANIA, INC.
4300 INDUSTRIAL PARK RD, CAMP HILL, PA, 17011

as Principal, hereinafter called the Principal, and

TRAVELERS CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY OF AMERICA
One Tower Square, Bond/5PB, Hartford, CT, 06183

a corporation duly organized under the laws of the state of cT s
as Surety, hereinafter called Surety, are held and firmly bound unto

MIDDLE PAXTON TOWNSHIP

10 ELIZABETH AVENUE, DAUPHIN, PA, 17018 as
Obligee, hereinafter called the Obligee, in the sum of Ten percent of the total bid amount
Dollars ($ 10% of the total bid amount ), for the payment of which sum well and truly to be made, the

said Principal and the said Surety, bind ourselves, our heirs, executors, administrators, successors, and
assigns, jointly and severally, by these presents.

WHEREAS, the Principal is herewith submitting a bid or proposal for
SOLID WASTE AND RECYCLABLES COLLECTION

NOW, THEREFORE, if the Obligee shall accept the bid of the Principal and the Principal shall enter into
a Contract with the Obligee in accordance with the terms of such bid, and give such bond or bonds as may
be specified in the bidding or Contract Documents with good and sufficient surety for the faithful
performance of such Contract and for the prompt payment of labor and material furnished in the
prosecution thereof, or in the event of the failure of the Principal to enter such Contract and give such
bond or bonds, if the Principal shall pay to the Obligee the difference not to exceed the penalty hereof
between the amount specified in said bid and such larger amount for which the Obligee may in good faith
contract with another party to perform the Work covered by said bid, or if a different penalty is required
in the bidding documents, pay to the Obligee the penalty as required in the bidding documents not to
exceed the penalty hereof, then this obligation shall be null and void, otherwise to remain in full force and
effect.

Signed, sealed and executed this 8th day of September _,2022

TRAVELERS CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY
WASTE MANAGEMENT OF PENNSYLVANIA, INC. OF AMERICA

Principal Surety

By: % @%‘
Andrea M. Pgnaloza, Attorney-in-Fact s

Witness: (woda. L o2 Witness: (i/ (Z/@

-

Amanda George U Lupe Tyler




POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNOWN ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS that Waste Management, Inc. and each
of its direct and indirect majority owned subsidiaries (the “WM Entities™), have constituted and
appointed and do hereby appoint KD Conrad, Vanessa Dominguez, Melissa Fortier, Michael J.
Herrod, Jennifer L. Jakaitis, Terri L. Morrison, Andrea M. Penaloza, Patricia A. Rambo, Lupe
Tyler, Susan A. Welsh, Donna Williams, and Misty Wright of Aon Risk Services, Inc., each its
true and lawful Attorney-in-fact to execute under such designation in its name, to affix the
corporate seal approved by the WM Entities for such purpose, and to deliver for and on its behalf
as surety thereon or otherwise, bonds of any of the following classes, to wit:

1. Surety bonds to the United States of America or any agency thereof, and lease and
miscellaneous surety bonds required or permitted under the laws, ordinances or
regulations of any State, City, Town, Village, Board or any other body or
organization, public or private.

2. Bonds on behalf of WM Entities in connection with bids, proposals or contracts.

The foregoing powers granted by the WM Entities shall be subject to and conditional upon the
written direction of a duly appointed officer of the applicable WM Entity (or any designee of any
such officer) to execute and deliver any such bonds.

The signatures and attestations of such Attomeys-in-fact and the seal of the WM Entity may be
affixed to any such bond, policy or to any certificate relating thereto by facsimile and any such
bond, policy or certificate bearing such facsimile signatures or facsimile seal shall be valid and
binding upon the applicable WM Entity when so affixed.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the WM Entities have cansed these presents to be signed by
the Vice President and Treasurer and its corporate seal to be hereto affixed. This power of

attorney is in effect as of _ September 8 ,2022 .
Witness: On behalf of Waste Management, Inc. and
each of the other WM Entities

David Reed
Vice President and Treasurer

ﬁam% DuAAS



Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America
‘ N Travelers Casualty and Surety Company
TRAVELERS J St. Paul Fire and Marine Insurance Company

POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS: That Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America, Travelers Casualty and Surety Company, and
St. Paul Fire and Marine Insurance Company are corporations duly organized under the laws of the State of Connecticut (herein
collectively called the "Companies"), and that the Companies do hereby make, constitute and appoint Andrea M. Penaloza of
HOUSTON , Texas , their true and lawful Attorney(s)-in-Fact to sign, execute, seal and
acknowledge any and all bonds, recognizances, conditional undertakings and other writings obligatory in the nature thereof on behalf of
the Companies in their business of guaranteeing the fidelity of persons, guaranteeing the performance of contracts and executing or
guaranteeing bonds and undertakings required or permitted in any actions or proceedings allowed by law.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Companies have caused this instrument to be signed, and their corporate seals to be hereto affixed, this 21st day of April,
2021.

State of Connecticut
A

By: o
City of Hartford ss. Robert L. Raney*Senior Vice President

On this the 21st day of Aprll, 2021, before me personally appeared Robert L. Raney, who acknowledged himself to be the Senior
Vice President of each of the Companies, and that he, as such, being authorized so to do, executed the foregoing instrument for the
purposes therein contained by signing on behalf of said Companies by himself as a duly authorized officer.

el :
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | hereunto set my hand and official seal. fﬁﬁz’"‘“ } %; N f
BRI ) Y 4 : 4
My Commission expires the 30th day of June, 2026 % "‘:@W? 7 f
K o g ™ Anna P. Nowlik, Notary Public
A /

This Power of Attorney is granted under and by the authority of the following resolutions adopted by the Boards of Directors of each of
the Companies, which resolutions are now in full force and effect, reading as follows:

RESOLVED, that the Chalrman, the President, any Vice Chairman, any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President, any Vice
President, any Second Vice President, the Treasurer, any Assistant Treasurer, the Corporate Secretary or any Assistant Secrelary may appoint
Aftorneys-in-Fact and Agents to act for and on behalf of the Company and may give such appointee such authority as his or her certificate of authority
may prescribe to sign with the Company's name and seal with the Company's seal bonds, recognizances, contracts of indemnity, and other writings
obligatory in the nature of a bond, recognizance, or conditional undertaking, and any of said officers or the Board of Directors at any time may
remove any such appointee and revoke the power given him or her; and it is

FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Chairman, the President, any Vice Chairman, any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President or
any Vice President may delegate all or any part of the foregoing authority to one or more officers or employees of this Company, provided
that each such delegation is in writing and a copy thereof is filed in the office of the Secretary; and it Is

FURTHER RESOLVED, that any bond, recognizance, contract of indemnity, or writing obligatory in the nature of a bond, recegnizance,
or conditional undertaking shall be valid and binding upon the Company when (a) signed by the President, any Vice Chaiman, any Executive
Vice President, any Senior Vice President or any Vice President, any Second Vice President, the Treasurer, any Assistant Treasurer, the
Corporate Secretary or any Assistant Secretary and duly attested and sealed with the Company's seal by a Secretary or Assistant Secretary;
or (b) duly executed (under seal, if required) by one or more Attorneys-in-Fact and Agents pursuant to the power prescribed in his or her
certificate or their certificates of authority or by one or more Company officers pursuant to a written delegation of authority; and it is

FURTHER RESOLVED, that the signature of each of the following officers: President, any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President,
any Vice President, any Assistant Vice President, any Secretary, any Assistant Secretary, and the seal of the Company may be affixed by facsimile to
any Power of Attorney or to any certificate relating thereto appointing Resident Vice Presidents, Resident Assistant Secretaries or Attorneys-in-
Fact for purposes only of executing and attesting bonds and undertakings and other writings obligatory in the nature thereof, and any such Power of
Attorney or certificate bearing such facsimile signature or facsimile seal shall be valid and binding upon the Company and any such power so executed
and certified by such facsimile signature and facsimile seal shall be valid and binding on the Company in the future with respect to any bond or
understanding to which it is attached.

|, Kevin E. Hughes, the undersigned, Assistant Secretary of each of the Companies, do hereby certify that the above and foregoing Is a
true and correct copy of the Power of Attorney executed by said Companies, which remains in full force and effect.

Dated this - 8th ﬁay___of September , 2022

fo & feope

£Kevin E. Hughes, AssiStant Secretary

To verify the authenticity of this Power of Attorney, please call us at 1-800-421-3880.

_ " Please refer to the above-named Attorney(s)-in-Fact and the details of the bond to which this Power of Attorney is attached.



TRAYELERS CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY O AMERICK

HERTFORE:, CONNECTICUT 0&18%

FINGNGIAL STATEMENT AR OF DECERMBER 31, 2021

CAPINAL STOGK $ 6,440,000

ASSETS USBILITIES & SURFLUS
BONDS $ 44I706R4TS LOTSES § 1230258147
STOCKS 90,882,063 LOSS ATVUSTRERNT EXPESSES 157 268812
CASTH A [RYESTED CASH 3978380 COMBRSIONS AHBTTSAG
OTHER MYESTED ASSETS 5,509,133 OTHER EXPENSES 46,807,590
SECURITIES L ENDIRG RENVESTED COLLATERAL ASSETS TAIANE6 TAXES, L ICENSES A FEES 1BE55025
INVESTMENT INEOME DUE AR ACCRUEDR IELFEI2 CURRERT FEDERAL AN FOREIGHINCOME TAKES GFR T
PREMAN BALANCES 294,087,729 UNEARNED PREVLIS 122347 629
RENSURANGE RECOUERABIE TO.SFF BAT ADVANCE CRERI t BIBS
NET DEFERREDS TAX ASSET 60,1960 POLICYROLDER DRADENDS 14,256,052
OTHER ASSETS 3BT CEDED RENSURANEE NET CIREMILIAS BAYNELE STATBAID
AFAQUNTS VATHHELD: S RETARED BY COUPANY FOR QTHERS 4007 038
REMITTANCES AND IDEME SOT MLLICATED TOSTY A
FRORABICR FOR REMSURRNCE 6,873,132
PRYIALE T PARENT, SUBSHIARIES AND SFFILITES AOLRIAIN
PAYABLE FOR SECURIES (ENIING TAIROES
ESCHERT LABILITY 537,032
RETREOACTIVE RENSURSNCE RESERVE ASSUMED 818,092
OTHER ACCRUED EXFENSES AND LABLITIES 250,005
TOTAL LIABILTIES: § Z00T,500277
CABTIAL STOCIK Y
PRI N SURPLLS 43350AT60
OTHER SURPLLS 12 2T
TOTAL SURFLUS T POLICYHOLOERS 3§ ZAEAGT G5
TOTAL ASSETS TOTAL UABILIMES & SURPLUS 3 EAans091%

KTHTE QF CORNECTICLT

COURTY QF HORTEQRD:

CITY OF HARTFORD:

o

RUCHAEL. JL OO0, BENG OULY SINORN, SAYS THAT HE 1§ VICE PRESIDENT — FINANCE, OF TRAVELERS CREUALTY ANID SURIETY COUPAMNY OF AMERICS,

AMD THAT TO THE BEST OF HIS KNOWLENGE AND BELIES, THE FOREGCHNG 1S 4, TRUE AN CORREDT STRNERENT OF THE FRANCIAL CONDITION GF SKIT

CORMPARY AS OF THE 15T DAY OF RECERMBER, 2024

SUBSCRIBED AND SHURM TO BEFORE ME THIS
171H DAY OF MARGH), 2022
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iy
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. Sraey Sreblic
| Dy Commivston Bypinie Memventfion 30, P23

SUSAN k. WEISSLEDRER




TRAVELERS J

One Tower Square
Hartford, CT 06183

September 8, 2022

MIDDLE PAXTON TOWNSHIP
10 ELIZABETH AVENUE
DAUPHIN, PA 17018

Principal: WASTE MANAGEMENT OF PENNSYLVANIA, INC.
Bid Date: September 8, 2022
Description: SOLID WASTE AND RECYCLABLES COLLECTION

Dear Sir/fMadam:

We, TRAVELERS CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY OF AMERICA agree that

in the event an award is made to WASTE MANAGEMENT OF PENNSYLVANIA, INC.
on the project as captioned we will execute the necessary Performance and/or Payment
Bonds that may be required.

Sincerely,

TRAVELERS CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY OF AMERICA

. lorallg-

Andrea M. Penaloza
Attorney-in-Fact

S -



Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America
Travelers Casualty and Surety Company

A,
TRAVELER)S J St. Paul Fire and Marine Insurance Company

POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS: That Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America, Travelers Casualty and Surety Company, and
St. Paul Fire and Marine Insurance Company are corporations duly organized under the laws of the State of Connecticut (herein
collectively called the "Companies"), and that the Companies do hereby make, constitute and appoint Andrea M. Penaloza of
HOUSTON , Texas . their frue and lawful Attorney(s)-in-Fact to sign, execute, seal and
acknowledge any and all bonds, recognizances, conditional undertakings and other writings obligatory in the nature thereof on behalf of
the Companies in their business of guaranteeing the fidelity of persons, guaranteeing the performance of contracts and executing or
guaranteeing bonds and undertakings required or permitted in any actions or proceedings allowed by law.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Companies have caused this instrument to be signed, and their corporate seals to be hereto affixed, this 21st day of April,
2021.

State of Connecticut ;
By: & 7
City of Hartford ss. Robert L. Raney*=Senior Vice President

On this the 21st day of April, 2021, before me personally appeared Robert L. Raney, who acknowledged himself to be the Senior
Vice President of each of the Companies, and that he, as such, being authorized so to do, executed the foregoing instrument for the
purposes therein contained by signing on behalf of said Companies by himself as a duly authorized officer.

T T, .
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | hereunto set my hand and official seal. jf.?j-‘-‘*'"m % ; o
v, & 4
My Commission expires the 30th day of June, 2026 g ' %2& f :

™ Anna P. Nowik, Notary Public

This Power of Attorney is granted under and by the authority of the following resolutions adopted by the Boards of Direclors of each of
the Companies, which resolutions are now in full force and effect, reading as follows:

RESOLVED, that the Chairman, the President, any Vice Chairman, any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President, any Vice
President, any Second Vice President, the Treasurer, any Assistant Treasurer, the Corporate Secretary or any Assistant Secretary may appoint
Attorneys-in-Fact and Agents to act for and on behalf of the Company and may give such appointee such authority as his or her certificate of authority
may prescribe to sign with the Company's name and seal with the Company's seal bonds, recognizances, contracts of indemnity, and other writings
obligatory in the nature of a bond, recognizance, or conditional undertaking, and any of said officers or the Board of Directors at any time may
remove any such appointee and revoke the power given him or her; and it is

FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Chairman, the President, any Vice Chairman, any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President or
any Vice President may delegate all or any part of the foregoing authority to one or more officers or employees of this Company, provided
that each such delegation is in writing and a copy thereof is filed in the office of the Secretary; and it is

FURTHER RESOLVED, that any bond, recognizance, confract of indemnity, or writing obligatory in the nature of a bond, recognizance,
or conditional undertaking shall be valid and binding upon the Company when (a) signed by the President, any Vice Chairman, any Executive
Vice President, any Senior Vice President or any Vice President, any Second Vice President, the Treasurer, any Assistant Treasurer, the
Corporate Secretary or any Assistant Secretary and duly attested and sealed with the Company's seal by a Secretary or Assistant Secretary;
or (b) duly executed (under seal, if required) by one or more Attorneys-in-Fact and Agents pursuant to the power prescribed in his or her
certificate or their certificates of authority or by one or more Company officers pursuant to a written delegation of authority; and it is

FURTHER RESOLVED, that the signature of each of the following officers: President, any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President,
any Vice President, any Assistant Vice President, any Secretary, any Assistant Secretary, and the seal of the Company may be affixed by facsimile to
any Power of Attorney or to any certificate relating thereto appointing Resident Vice Presidents, Resident Assistant Secretaries or Attorneys-in-
Fact for purposes only of executing and attesting bonds and undertakings and other writings obligatory in the nature thereof, and any such Power of
Attomney or certificate bearing such facsimile signature or facsimile seal shall be valid and binding upon the Company and any such power so executed
and certified by such facsimile signature and facsimile seal shall be valid and binding on the Company in the future with respect to any bond or
understanding to which it is attached.

|, Kevin E. Hughes, the undersigned, Assistant Secretary of each of the Companies, do hereby ceriify that the above and foregoing is a
true and correct copy of the Power of Attorney executed by said Companies, which remains in full force and effect.

Dated this.-8th . - 'q:ag of September , 2022

o

Kevin E. Hughes, AssiStant Secretary

N To veriﬁr the authenticity of this Power of Attorney, please call us at 1-800-421-3880.
Please refer to the above-named Attorney(s)-in-Fact and the details of the bond to which this Power of Attorney is attached.



BID FORM - PAGE #1

FORM OF PROPOSAL

Notice: This Form of Proposal must be completely executed and shall not be removed from the Bidding
Documents to which it is attached.

MIDDLE PAXTON TOWNSHIP, DAUPHIN COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA

The undersigned, having read and carefully examined the Bidding Documents, hereby proposes to furnish all labor,
equipment, and appliances to collect and dispose of all MSW, and collect and market all recyclable materials
generated by residential establishments within the corporate limits of the Township for the prices set forth for each
item in figures, and pursuant to and in strict and full compliance with the Bidding Documents, hereto annexed and,
by this reference, made a part of this Bid for the period of two (2) years, beginning on the October 1, 2022 and
ending on September 30, 2024 for Middle Paxton Township.

Bidder’s proposals shall include all applicable federal, state, and local fees, including any state mandated
recycling, host, and environmental stewardship fees.

Should there be a discrepancy between the numbers provided on the Bid Form, then, in all such cases, the
per month bid numbers shall be considered binding by the Township.

PLEASE NOTE:
e The numbers of dwelling units listed on the Bid Form are estimates.

o The Contractor will be required to travel on an approved list of private roads that may not be suitable
for standard trucks. The list will be provided by Middle Paxton Township.



BID FORM — MANUAL COLLECTION SERVICE -PAGE #2

BASE PROGRAM BID

Regular Collection Service - MSW collection and disposal, including one bulk item and recyclable collection and

delivery on a weekly basis:

Year1$ 49.85 per month, per customer, or $ 598.20 per year X 2,200=§ _1,316,040.00
Year2 § B per month, per customer, or $ 634.08 per year X 2,220 =§ 1,394,976.00

TOTAL BID AMOUNT §_2,711,016.00

Alternate_Collection Service - MSW collection and disposal, including one bulk item (MONTHLY) and
recyclable collection and delivery on a WEEKLY basis:

Year 1 $_49.85 per month, per customer, or $__598.20 per year X 2,200 =§ __1,316,040,00
g 634.08 ser your X 2,220~ § ;39497600

Year?2 $ 52.84 per month, per customer, or

TOTAL BID AMOUNT $ 2,711,016.00

Per-Container of MSW over and above the two (2) container limit in the Regular Collection Service and

offered separately as an Optional Per-Container Collection Service:

1.Year1$__ 25.00 Per-Container

2.Year2$ Abial Per-Container

B tems over a ve the one (1) per week limit under the Regular Collection Service and offered
separately under the Optim;él Per-Container Collection Service:

1, Year 1 $__40.00 per item

2. Year2 $ __40.00 per item




BID FORM — AUTOMATED/SEMI AUTOMATED COLLECTION SERVICE — PAGE #3

BASE PROGRAM BID

Regular Collection Service - MSW collection and disposal, including one bulk item and recyclable collection and

delivery on a weekly basis:
Year 1 $ _NO BID per month, per customer, or §_ NO BID per year X 2,200 =$_NO BID

Year2 $ NO BID per month, per customer, or § _ NO BID per year X 2,220 =$ _ NO BID

TOTAL BID AMOUNT $ __ NO BID

Alternate Collection Service - MSW collection and disposal, including one bulk item (MONTHLY) and

recyclable collection and delivery on a weekly basis:
Year 1 $ _NO BID per month, per customer, or §__NO BID per year X 2,200 =$_NO BID

Year2 $ _ NO BID per month, per customer, or $ __ NO BID per year X 2,220 =% _ NO BID

TOTAL BID AMOUNT §  NO BID

Per-Container of MSW over and above the two (2) container limit in the Regular Collection Service and

offered separately as an Optional Per-Container Collection Service:
1. Year 1 §_ NOBID Per-Container
2. Year2 § _ NOBID Per-Container

Bulk Items over and above the one (1) per week limit under the Regular Collection Service and offered

separately under the Optional Per-Container Collection Service:
1. Year 1§ _ NOBID per item
2. Year2 §_ NOBID per item

I



BID FORM — PAGE #4

SECTION ONE, PARAGRAPH 1.15
VEHICLE FUEL ADJUSTOR

Bidders are required to state the portion of their total costs that are attributable to vehicle fuel.

Specifically, vehicle fuel makes up Seven percent (_7 %) of the dollar amounts listed above.

SECTION ONE, PARAGRAPH 1.28

CONTRACT EXTENSION

The Successful Bidder and the Township may mutually agree to extend the Contract for a total of not more than
One (1) additional year. The cost for monthly services charged by the Successful Bidder in any extension year shall
increase no more than the following percentages. Such percentages shall be applied to the monthly costs for services
listed by the Successful Bidder in its bid. Such percentages increases shall not be applied to changes in monthly
costs due to the Vehicle Fuel Adjustor or increases in monthly costs due to increased tipping fee charges for MSW,
as may be instituted by the County for the Harrisburg Incinerator.

I. Year 3 6.U%

This bid may be withdrawn at any time prior to the scheduled time for the opening of bids or any Authorized

postponement thereof.

ATTEST: Waste Management of Pennsylvania, Inc.
Name of Bidder
by e (X
Assistant Secrgfary , Joseph Krugovich President e

4300 Industrial Park Road, Camp Hill, PA 17011
Address

(SEAL) ! eleplmne I




BIDDER’S AFFIDAVIT

I, Christopher Farley , being duly sworn, state that I am the
(Name of Person signing Bicd)
President of Waste Management of Pennsylvania, Inc.
(Title) {Name of Bidder)

and that I am duly authorized to sign the Bid and that the Bid is the true offer of the Bidder, that
the seal attached thereto is the seal of the Bidder, and that each, every and all declarations and -
statements contained in the Bid and any and all affidavits, and documents submitted as required by
the Bidding Documents are true to the best of my knowledge and belief.

CENL N

(Signature ofAffiaht)

Christopher Farley
(Printed Name)

President
Title

SWORN TO AND SU SqC}IBED
BEF ME THIS 9/ DAY
, 2022,

=77 Ndary Public

My Commission Expires:

N Comnmwaa!m of Pennsylvania - Notary Seal
ROSE KAMINSKI, Notary Public

County
Commission Expires August 28, 2023
W Commission Number 1081396




BIDDERS QUESTIONNAIRE

(IMPORTANT- Each bidder must fully and completely fill out and answer this questionnaire,
Attach additional sheets if necessary.)

1. Experience in the collection and disposal of garbage, trash, ashes, and rubbish. How many
years have you engaged in the business of collecting and disposing of the material?
53 ‘

2. Please attach a list of municipal contracts that you have had within the last seven (7) years,
including the name of the municipality, the date the contract was initiated, the term of the
contract, the name of a contact person and the telephone number.

3. Have you ever defaulted on any contract held by you? If so, give details:
NO

4. Are there any unsatisfied judgments entered against you'? If so, give details:
SEE ATTACHED LITIGATION SUMMARY REPORT

5. Have you ever been declared to not be a responsible bidder by any municipality? If so, give
details: __NO

6. Have you ever been declared to be in default of a contract by any municipality? If so, give
details: _ N

7. Are you currently engaged in litigation with any municipality? If so, give details:
SEE ATTACHED LITIGATION SUMMARY REPORT

8. Give name and address of Surety Company which has agreed to act as surety on your
performance bond should the contract be awarded to you:
Travelets Casualty and Surety Company of America, One Tower Square, Bond 5/PB, Hartford, CT 01683

9. List below the names and addresses of Surety Companies, which have heretofore bonded you
on municipal contracts: _See attached list

10. Give address and telephone number of local office. If none now exists, indicate proposed

location and name of staff personnel in charge. Also, list office hours and personal phone
number of Bidder. 4300 INDUSTRIAL PAR A

DON ISABELLA BA i\ RIDAY

A

11. Attach hereto is a full and complete statement, under notarized oath, of financial operating
statement for prior year's operation. SEE ATTACHED

fii



------ o Waste Management of Pennsylvania inc.
m 4300 Industrial Park Rd.
e Camp Hill, PA 17011

Bidders Questionnaire, Question #9

1. Federal Insurance Company: 202B Hall's Mill Rd, Whitehouse Station, NJ 08889
2. Liberty Mutual Insurance Company: 175 Berkely St., Boston, MA 02116
3. Western Surety company: 151 N. Franklin St., Chicago, IL 60606

s



The Bidder hereby certifies that the answers to this Questionnaire are true and correct and
further agrees that the said answers shall be considered as an integral part of the annexed bid.

9/21/9023

Waste Management of Pennsylvania, Inc.

Date

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED
BEFORE ME THIS 3/ % DAY
. 2022.

Notary Public

My Commission Expires:

Commonwealth of Pennsylvania - Notary Seal
ROSE KAMINSK], Notary Public

. Bucks County
‘My Commission Expires August 28, 2023
Commission Number 1081386

Name of Bidder
By: QQAH)\(
\

Name: __ Christopher Farley

Title: President




