DOVER TOWNSHIP BID TABULATION

2025-2027 Mowing of Township Properties

Bidder Bidder Bidder
Pricing for the Mowing of Townshp Properties for the years of
2025, 2026, 2027.
CLG Services LLC Horizon Lawns Effluent Retrieval Services Inc.
Site LD #
Site DESCRIPTION 2025 Annual Unit Price | 2026 Annual Unit Price | 2027 Annual Unit Price 2025 Annual Unit Price | 2026 Annual Unit Price | 2027 Annual Unit Price 2025 Annual Unit Price | 2026 Annual Unit Price | 2027 Annual Unit Price
1 Water Tank Staunton Ave $640.00 $660.00 $680.00 $853.06 $893.16 $893.16 $1,815.50 $1,815.50 $1,815.50
2 Wells 1 & 2 1800 Poplars Rd $960.00 $990.00 $1,020.00 $1,279.58 $1,339.72 $1,339.72 $7,425.00 $7,425.00 $7,425.00
3 Water Tank 3 2591 Locust Rd $640.00 $660.00 $680.00 $853.06 $893.15 $893.15 $1,815.00 $1,815.00 $1,815.00
4 Well 4 2981 Pine Rd $640.00 $660.00 $680.00 $853.06 $893.15 $893.15 $3,465.00 $3,465.00 $3,465.00
5 Well 5 3095 Emig Mill Rd $320.00 $330.00 $340.00 $426.52 $446.57 $446.57 $1,815.50 $1,815.50 $1,815.50
6 Well 6 1641 Butter Rd $480.00 $495.00 $510.00 $639.78 $669.85 $669.85 $2,475.00 $2,475.00 $2,475.00
7 Well 11 3304 Cardinal Ln $480.00 $495.00 $510.00 $639.78 $669.85 $669.85 $1,815.50 $1,815.50 $1,815.50
8 Well8 2395 Conewago Rd $256.00 $264.00 $272.00 $341.22 $357.26 $357.26 $2,475.00 $2,475.00 $2,475.00
9 Well9 2980 Grenway Rd $256.00 $264.00 $272.00 $341.22 $357.26 $357.26 $1,815.00 $1,815.00 $1,815.00
10 Well 10 2937-B Village Square Dr $320.00 $330.00 $340.00 $426.52 $446.57 $446.57 $1,815.00 $1,815.00 $1,815.00
1 Booster 6280 Old Carlisle Rd $576.00 $594.00 $612.00 $767.75 $803.83 $803.83 $1,815.00 $1,815.00 $1,815.00
12 Water Tank Sky Top Trail $480.00 $495.00 $510.00 $639.78 $669.85 $669.85 $4,207.50 $4,207.50 $4,207.50
13 Water Tank Admire Rd $480.00 $495.00 $510.00 $639.78 $669.85 $669.85 $1,815.00 $1,815.00 $1,815.00
14 Pump House Admire Springs Dr $384.00 $396.00 $408.00 $511.84 $535.90 $535.90 $1,815.00 $1,815.00 $1,815.00
15 Lehr Park Davidsburg Rd $10,368.00 $10,679.00 $11,000.00 $12,195.56 $12,768.75 $12,768.75 $78,540.00 $78,540.00 $78,540.00
16 | Dover ggﬂ‘(m“”'ty West Canal Rd $4,800.00 $4,944.00 $5,092.00 $6,397.89 $6,698.59 $6,698.59 $14,025.00 $14,025.00 $14,025.00
Brookside Park,
17 Ballfield, Trolley Fox Run Rd & Rocky Rd $6,048.00 $6,230.00 $6,417.00 $8,061.41 $8,440.30 $8,440.30 $30,937.50 $30,937.50 $30,937.50
Trail
18 Mayfield Park Sedgewick Ave $4,160.00 $4,285.00 $4,414.00 $5,544.88 $5,805.49 $5,805.49 $29,700.00 $29,700.00 $29,700.00
19 Edgewood Park [Broughton Dr & Nittany Dr $2,560.00 $2,637.00 $2,716.00 $3,412.24 $3,572.62 $3,572.62 $10,516.20 $10,516.20 $10,516.20
20 Edgewood Park Greenfield Dr $800.00 $824.00 $849.00 $1,066.32 $1,066.32 $1,066.32 $4,702.50 $4,702.50 $4,702.50
21 Edgewood Park Devonshire Dr $640.00 $660.00 $680.00 $853.06 $893.16 $893.16 $4,207.50 $4,207.50 $4,207.50
22 Edgewood Park Mariborough Dr $320.00 $330.00 $340.00 $426.52 $426.52 $426.52 $2,475.00 $2,475.00 $2,475.00
23 Sunrise Acres Partridge Dr $960.00 $990.00 $1,020.00 $1,269.19 $1,328.84 $1,328.84 $5,692.50 $5,692.50 $5,692.50
24 Rock Creek Wyngate Rd $960.00 $990.00 $1,020.00 $1,269.19 $1,328.84 $1,328.84 $5,692.50 $5,692.50 $5,692.50
25 Barwood Milky Way Rd $960.00 $990.00 $1,020.00 $639.78 $669.85 $669.85 $5,692.50 $5,692.50 $5,692.50
26 Barwood Solar Dr $256.00 $264.00 $272.00 $341.22 $357.26 $357.26 $1,815.00 $1,815.00 $1,815.00
27 Golden Villas Tonys Dr $480.00 $495.00 $510.00 $639.78 $669.85 $669.85 $2,920.00 $2,920.00 $2,920.00
28 Grandview Pine Rd (|166n'é;’ts) (open $4,800.00 $4,944.00 $5,002 $6,397.88 $6,698.58 $6,698.58 $6,237.00 $6,237.00 $6,237.00
29 Honey Run Hadley Dr $1,280.00 $1,318.00 $1,358.00 $1,706.12 $1,786.31 $1,786.31 $6,237.00 $6,237.00 $6,237.00
30 Tower Village Wyngate Rd $1,120.00 $1,154.00 $1,189.00 $1,492.84 $1,563.00 $1,563.00 $3,465.00 $3,465.00 $3,465.00
31 Emig Mill Village Village Square Dr $1,120.00 $1,154.00 $1,189.00 $2,031.09 $2,126.55 $2,126.55 $3,588.00 $3,588.00 $3,588.00
North of the
32 Borough Sewer 2171 George St $480.00 $495.00 $510.00 $639.78 $669.85 $669.85 $1,815.00 $1,815.00 $1,815.00
Pumping Station
33 Treatment Plant 851 Graffius Rd $5,760.00 $5,933.00 $6,111.00 $7,677.53 $8,038.37 $8,038.37 $1,237.50 $1,237.50 $1,237.50
Oak Hill Lane Between 3520 and 3600
34 Right - of - Way Rock Creek Road $256.00 $264.00 $272.00 $616.00 $644.95 $644.95 $1,815.10 $1,815.10 $1,815.10
35 Right - of - Way Equinox and Galaxy $280.00 $288.00 $297.00 $504.00 $527.69 $527.69 $1,815.10 $1,815.10 $1,815.10
Toatals $55,320.00 $56,996.00 $58,712.00 $72,395.23 $75,727.66 $75,727.66 $259,509.90 $259,509.90 $259,509.90




DOVER TOWNSHIP BID TABULATION
2025-2027 Mowing of Township Properties

Pricing for the Mowing of Townshp Properties for the years of
2025, 2026, 2027.

Bidder

Bidder

Bidder

Mitzels Lawn Care Service, LLC

Site LD #
Site DESCRIPTION 2025 Annual Unit Price | 2026 Annual Unit Price [ 2027 Annual Unit Price 2025 Annual Unit Price [ 2026 Annual Unit Price | 2027 Annual Unit Price 2025 Annual Unit Price | 2026 Annual Unit Price | 2027 Annual Unit Price
1 Water Tank Staunton Ave $1,280.00 $1,280.00 $1,280.00
2 Wells 1 & 2 1800 Poplars Rd $4,160.00 $4,160.00 $4,160.00
3 Water Tank 3 2591 Locust Rd $1,280.00 $1,280.00 $1,280.00
4 Well 4 2981 Pine Rd $2,080.00 $2,080.00 $2,080.00
5 Well 5 3095 Emig Mill Rd $1,120.00 $1,120.00 $1,120.00
6 Well 6 1641 Butter Rd $1,120.00 $1,120.00 $1,120.00
7 Well 11 3304 Cardinal Ln No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 Well8 2395 Conewago Rd $1,440.00 $1,440.00 $1,440.00
9 Well9 2980 Grenway Rd $1,440.00 $1,440.00 $1,440.00
10 Well 10 2937-B Village Square Dr $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00
11 Booster 6280 Old Carlisle Rd $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00
12 Water Tank Sky Top Trail $1,920.00 $1,920.00 $1,920.00
13 Water Tank Admire Rd $960.00 $960.00 $960.00
14 Pump House Admire Springs Dr $960.00 $960.00 $960.00
15 Lehr Park Davidsburg Rd No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 | Dover (P:;’::m“”'ty West Canal Rd $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
Brookside Park,
17 Ballfield, Trolley | Fox Run Rd & Rocky Rd $18,960.00 $19,200.00 $19,680.00
Trail
18 Mayfield Park Sedgewick Ave $13,200.00 $13,200.00 $13,680.00
19 Edgewood Park |Broughton Dr & Nittany Dr $6,720.00 $6,720.00 $6,720.00
20 Edgewood Park Greenfield Dr $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00
21 Edgewood Park Devonshire Dr No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 Edgewood Park Marlborough Dr No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 Sunrise Acres Partridge Dr $3,840.00 $3,840.00 $4,160.00
24 Rock Creek Wyngate Rd No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 Barwood Milky Way Rd No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 Barwood Solar Dr No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 Golden Villas Tonys Dr No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 Grandview | FneRd (:aﬁn'é‘)’ts) (open No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 Honey Run Hadley Dr $3,840.00 $3,840.00 $4,160
30 Tower Village Wyngate Rd $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $3,520.00
31 Emig Mill Village Village Square Dr No Bid No Bid No Bid
North of the
32 Borough Sewer 2171 George St $1,280.00 $1,280.00 $1,280.00
Pumping Station
33 Treatment Plant 851 Graffius Rd No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Hill Lane Between 3520 and 3600
34 Right - of - Way Rock Creek Road $960.00 $960.00 $960.00
35 Right - of - Way Equinox and Galaxy No Bid No Bid No Bid
Toatals $84,160.00 $84,400.00 $86,320.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00




