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Repairs Planned for Next Week on SB I-83 Bridge Over Market Street 
(Route 462) in York County 

Work will allow ramp from Market Street to SB I-83 to open to traffic 

 
Harrisburg, PA – The Pennsylvania Department of Transportation (PennDOT) announced 
today that a contractor is scheduled to perform repairs next week on the southbound Interstate 
83 bridge spanning Market Street (Route 462) in York County. The ramp from Market Steet to 
southbound I-83 will open to traffic when this work is complete. 
 
Weather permitting, repairs will be performed Wednesday, October 11, and Thursday, October 
12.  
 
The contractor is scheduled to work from 10:00 AM to 3:00 PM Wednesday. A right lane 
restriction will be in place on eastbound Market Street during work hours.  
 
The amount of work that remains after that will determine when the contractor will complete 
repairs on Thursday.  Work may be performed during the same hours Thursday, or if more time 
is needed, from 7:00 PM Thursday to 6:00 AM Friday. An updated release will be issued when 
Thursday’s work scheduled is known. 
 
The ramp from Market Street to southbound I-83 will open to traffic when the repairs are 
completed.  
 
In the meantime, a detour for the Market Street ramp to southbound I-83 remains in place using 
Belmont Street to southbound I-83. 
 
A steel beam on the bridge was damaged several years ago by a vehicle strike. A recent bridge 
inspection revealed further deterioration to the beam. To ensure the safety of the traveling 
public, the ramp from Market Street to southbound I-83 was closed. 
 
JD Eckman, Inc., of Atglen, PA, is the contractor on this repair project. 
 
Motorists can check conditions on major roadways by visiting www.511PA.com. 511PA, which 
is free and available 24 hours a day, provides traffic delay warnings, weather forecasts, traffic 
speed information and access to more than 1,000 traffic cameras. 

511PA is also available through a smartphone application for iPhone and Android devices, by 
calling 5-1-1, or by following local alerts on X. 

mailto:dmthompson@pa.gov
http://www.511pa.com/
https://twitter.com/511PAHarrisburg


 

 

Subscribe to PennDOT news and traffic alerts in Adams, Cumberland, Dauphin, Franklin, 
Lancaster, Lebanon, Perry and York counties at PennDOT District 8. 

Information about infrastructure in District 8, including completed work and significant projects, 
is available at District 8 Results. Find PennDOT’s planned and active construction projects at 
PennDOT Projects. 

Find PennDOT news on X, Facebook, and Instagram. 
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Please refer to the project location map below: 
 

 
 
 

https://www.penndot.pa.gov/RegionalOffices/district-8/Pages/default.aspx
https://www.penndot.pa.gov/about-us/Results/districts/District8/Pages/index.aspx
https://gis.penndot.gov/paprojects/PAProjects.aspx
https://twitter.com/511PAHarrisburg
https://www.facebook.com/groups/phillypenndot
https://www.instagram.com/pennsylvaniadot/

